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 Th is book is the third in a developmental progression in which the struc-
ture of the earlier books forms the foundations of those that follow. Be-
cause of this, my acknowledgments must go back many years to manage-
rial mentors like Hugh McGregor, Morris Cowley, James Mackness, David 
Richardson, and Peter Foster, who gave me my early opportunities both 
to study at the University of Chicago and to begin my career as a profes-
sional manager with a series of challenging assignments. Business col-
leagues like Jim Mackay, Larry Hall, Jack Woodcock, Horace Ho, and 
Wayne Mang taught me a great deal both through their examples and the 
opportunities they gave me. Wayne, together with my colleagues at 
Russelsteel, supplied a safe base for researching my fi rst book,  Crisis & 
Renewal . 

 When I changed careers from manager to educator, several academic 
colleagues were of enormous help, especially Rod White and Jim Rush at 
what is now the Richard Ivey School of Business and Brenda Zimmerman 
at the Schulich School of Business. She introduced me to complexity theory 
and the work of ecologist C. S. “Buzz” Holling, on whose frameworks the 
concept that we named the  ecocycle  is based. John Alexander and the ex-
tended team at the Center for Creative Leadership provided a home for the 
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second book,  Learning from the Links , where I learned the huge diff erence 
between “know what” and “know how” and the importance of experience in 
the development of managers. 

 Th e “home” for this third book was home. Writers are oft en rather 
solitary creatures, and, with social networking all the rage, it’s easy to feel 
left  out of the rush to connect with everyone else. Th e connections that 
help me are typically deeper than these. Th ey are the writers and thinkers 
whose books surround me as I write and speak to me when I consult them 
and sometimes even when I don’t. Th ey are the living colleagues who ap-
preciate what it is that you are trying to do and send you helpful references 
and words of encouragement or read the endless draft s and off er editorial 
comment. Th ere are many of these people to thank. 

 Horace Ho hired me to design and deliver development programs in 
Hong Kong and China, where many of the practical ideas were developed 
and honed. Patrick Wang, CEO of Johnson Electric, trusted me with his 
people and his colleagues. Jim Mackay and Judy Huntington supplied reg-
ular encouragement and opportunities to implement some of the concepts 
in the public and not-for-profi t sectors. Garnet Garven, former dean of the 
University of Regina’s Faculty of Business Administration gave me an op-
portunity to teach keystone courses in their new EMBA program at the 
Kenneth Levene Graduate School of Business. Here I explored the teaching 
implications of the ecological mental model and tested a number of diff er-
ent approaches. 

 My friend Ann Graham has been a constant source of inspiration and 
contacts through her extensive network. She, together with my colleagues 
at  Strategy+Business , Art Kleiner, Rob Norton, and Ted Kinni, have en-
sured that I have stayed current with what is being written about manage-
ment and have continually challenged me to express myself as clearly as 
possible in my writing for that magazine. 

 Many people read draft s of the book and gave me very helpful feedback, 
including John Alexander, Maarten Asser, Mary Crossan, Adriaan Davidse, 
Barbara Demarest, Bob Dryburgh, Garnet Garven, Ann Graham, Charles 
Hampden-Turner, Wendy Keith, Ted Kinni, Art Kleiner, Kaihan Krippen-
dorff , Rob Norton, Alan Pearson, Tom Pirner, Jim Rush, Liz Rykert, Jen St 
Clair, Pat Th ompson, Rod White, Allister Wilson, and Jim Womack. Ann 
Graham read the manuscript several times and gave me a particularly help-
ful, detailed critique. 
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 Carol Franco has been enormously helpful, and I would also like to 
thank Martin and Farah Perelmuter for their continued support and advice; 
my agent, John Willig; and Myles Th ompson, publisher at Columbia Uni-
versity Press, for recognizing the value of the book; and Bridget Flannery-
McCoy for all her hard work to make it a reality. Pamela Nelson, production 
editor, and Carol Hoke, copy editor, did a meticulous job on the manuscript. 
Noah Arlow produced a compelling cover design, and Jennifer Jerome 
craft ed the interior. 

 Finally, the pleasure of having home as a base is that you are physically 
close to the family even if mentally you aren’t always “there.” My family 
has been totally supportive, and our young grandchildren have been a 
constant joy. My wife, Diana, read and edited every draft  and off ered count-
less helpful comments and much advice. Her love and support have been 
inexhaustible. If there are any mistakes of commission or omission, how-
ever, they are my responsibility. 
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